GRANT ST. WATERLINE IMPROVEMENTS

BID FORM
P.N. 5-R-002-25
CITY OF OLATHE, KANSAS

The following table is a list of bid items, estimated quantities, and the unit prices submitted by the bidder for the Grant Street Waterline Improvements project, P.N. 5-R-002-25.

Schedule of Values
LEATH & SONS, INC.
APPROX. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
ITEM UNITS | QUANTITY DOLLARS CENTS DOLLARS
P.N. 5-R-002-25 Base Bid

1 Mobilization LS 1 S 30,000 S 30,000.00
2 Traffic Control LS 1 S 30,000 S 30,000.00
3 Construction Staking LS 1 S 30,000 S 30,000.00
4 Clearing & Grubbing LS 1 S 5,000 S 5,000.00
5 Grading LS 1 S 5,000 S 5,000.00
6 Remove Existing Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 19 S 500 S 9,500.00
7 Install 6" C900 PVC Waterline LF 3,716 S 104 S 386,464.00
8 Install 6" RJ C900 PVC Waterline LF 931 S 108 S 100,548.00
9 Install 8" C900 PVC Waterline LF 4,024 S 112 S 450,688.00
10 Install 8" RJ C900 PVC Waterline LF 2,126 3 116 S 246,616.00
11 Install 12" C900 PVC Waterline LF 1,680 S 120 S 201,600.00
12 Install 12" RJ C900 PVC Waterline LF 765 S 125 S 95,625.00
13 6" 11.25 Degree Bend EA 2 S 448 S 896.00
14 6" 22.5 Degree Bend EA 4 S 417 S 1,668.00
15 6" 45 Degree Bend EA 47 S 454 S 21,338.00
16 6" 90 Degree Bend EA 7 S 485 S 3,395.00
17 8" 11.25 Degree Bend EA 3 S 540 S 1,620.00
18 8" 22.5 Degree Bend EA 2 S 558 S 1,116.00
19 8" 45 Degree Bend EA 88 S 563 S 49,544.00
20 8" 90 Degree Bend EA 4 S 605 S 2,420.00
21 12" 11.25 Degree Bend EA 5 S 898 S 4,490.00
22 12" 22.5 Degree Bend EA 1 S 920 S 920.00
23 12" 45 Degree Bend EA 25 S 973 $ 24,325.00
24 12" 90 Degree Bend EA 2 S 1,060 S 2,120.00
25 8"x6" Reducer EA 4 S 475 S 1,900.00
26 6"x6" Tee EA 8 S 565 S 4,520.00
27 8" Tee EA 2 3 825 S 1,650.00
28 8"x6" Tee EA 7 S 746 $ 5,222.00
29 12"x6" Tee EA 1 S 1,105 $ 1,105.00
30 12"x8" Tee EA 5 S 1,195 S 5,975.00
31 16"x16"x8" Tee EA 1 S 2,447 S 2,447.00
32 8"x6" Cross EA 1 S 1,361 S 1,361.00
33 8"x8" Cross EA 1 S 1,428 S 1,428.00
34 6" Solid Sleeve EA 26 S 447 S 11,622.00
35 8" Solid Sleeve EA 1 S 607 S 607.00
36 12" Solid Sleeve EA 5 S 934 S 4,670.00
37 16" Solid Sleeve EA 2 S 1,570 $ 3,140.00
38 Install 6" Gate Valve EA 31 S 1,436 S 44,516.00
39 Install 8" Gate Valve EA 25 S 2,084 S 52,100.00
40 Install 12" Gate Valve EA 4 S 3,838 S 15,352.00
4] Install 16" Butterfly Valve EA 2 S 6,641 $ 13,282.00
42 Install Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 25 S 8,580 N 214,500.00
43 Water Meter, Pit Replacement, and Connection at Main Line EA 231 S 2,000 S 462,000.00
44 Install 3/4" Type "K" Copper Service Line LF 7516 S 17 S 127,772.00
45a | Connection to existing pipe (A-6) LS 1 S 10,000 S 10,000.00
45b | Connection to existing pipe (A-8) LS 1 S 9,500 S 9,500.00
45¢ | Connection to existing pipe (A-11} LS 1 S 9,500 S 9,500.00
45d  [Connection to existing pipe (B-11) LS 1 S 9,500 S 9,500.00
45¢  |Connection to existing pipe (A-12) LS 1 $ 9,500 $ 9,500.00
45f | Connection to existing pipe (A-14) LS 1 S 9,500 $ 9,500.00
45g  |Connection to existing pipe (A-15) LS 1 S 9,500 S 9,500.00
45h  [Connection to existing pipe (A-16) LS 1 S 9,500 S 9,500.00
451 |Connection to existing pipe (B-16) LS 1 S 14,000 S 14,000.00
45) Connection to existing pipe (A-20) LS 1 S 10,000 S 10,000.00
45k |Connection to existing pipe (B-20) LS 1 S 17,000 S 17,000.00
451 Connection to existing pipe (A-21) LS 1 S 10,000 S 10,000.00
45m | Connection to existing pipe (A-23) LS 1 S 10,000 S 10,000.00
45n | Connection to existing pipe (A-26) LS 1 S 10,000 S 10,000.00
450 |Connection to existing pipe (B-26) LS 1 S 9,000 S 9,000.00
45p  [Connection to existing pipe (A-28) LS 1 S 9,000 S 9,000.00
45q  |Connection to existing pipe (B-28) LS 1 S 9,000 S 9,000.00
45r | Connection to existing pipe (A-29) LS 1 S 9,000 S 9,000.00
45s  [Connection to existing pipe (A-30) LS 1 S 9,000 S 9,000.00
45t |Connection to existing pipe (A-31) LS 1 S 9,000 S 9,000.00
45u  |Connection to existing pipe (A-35) LS 1 S 9,000 S 9,000.00
45v__ |Connection to existing pipe (B-35) LS 1 S 10,000 S 10,000.00
45w | Connection to existing pipe (D-35) LS 1 S 12,000 S 12,000.00




45x | Connection to existing pipe (A-39) LS 1 S 9,500 S 9,500.00
46 Abandon Existing Water Main LS 45 S 500 S 22,500.00
47 Install Straddie Block EA 87 S 1,200 S 104,400.00
48 Install Tracer Wire LF 13242 S 2 010 ] 8 27,808.20
49 Remove & Replace Asphalt Pavernent SY 6972 S 108 S 752,976.00
50 Remove & Replace Concrete Drive SY 88 S 108 S 9,504.00
51 Remove and Replace Concrete Sidewalk LF 39 N 50 S 1,950.00
52 Remove and Replace Concrete Curb & Gutter LF 190 S 38 - S 7,220.00
53 Sodding LS 1 S 30,000 S 30,000.00
54 Owner's Allowance (S500,000) LS 1 S 500,000 - S 500,000.00

APPROX. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

ITEM UNITS | QUANTITY DOLLARS CENTS DOLLARS

Pipe Burst Alternative Package (May Omit)

HDPE DR 11 PIPE BURST EXISTING WATER MAIN
55 (ADD 2 INCHES TO PLAN DIAMETER) LF 3,840 NO BID
(DRIVEWAY, CURB, AND SIDEWALK REPLACED FROM BURSTING SUBSIDIARY)
ALTERNATE BASE BID QUANTITIES

NO PAYMENT WILL BE MADE FOR LINE 7, 9, & 35. PAYMENT WILL INSTEAD BE MADE FOR LINE 7%, 9%, 49* INSTEAD.

7* Install 6" C900 PVC Waterline LF 1,197 N\O BID

9* Install 8" C900 PVC Waterline LF 2,704 NO BID

49* Remove & Replace Asphalt Pavement SY 5,086 NO BID
BASE BID TOTAL (ADD LINES 1-34) BASE BID TOTAL] S 4,378,420.20
(ADD LINES 1-55 less: 7, 9, and 49 add: 7%, 9%, and 49* (OR OPTIONALLY OMIT) PIPE BURST ALTERNATE TOTALl NO BID

LEATH & SONS, INC.




The undersigned successfully completed the bid process online at olatheks.bonfire.com and affirms that
the schedule of values table above matches the unit prices, line item amounts, and bid total amount
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Q%Iﬁ;gl;ﬂg ADDENDUM No. 1

GRANT ST WATERLINE IMPROVEMENTS 5-R-002-24

Date: January 8, 2026
Project No.: PN 5-R-002-25

This addendum is to pull subsidiary items out of the ‘Connection to Existing Pipe’ line items
(31a-31x). The schedule of values and the measurement & payment have been updated to
reflect the associated items pulled out of the connections. Fittings, valves, pipe, asphalt
restoration, etc. will no longer be subsidiary to ‘Connection to Existing Pipe’ line items under
this addendum.

There was also a clarifying clause added under the Measurement & Payment section under
the ‘Bid Alternate Pipe Burst’ section.

Regarding the Schedule of values:

The bid schedule has been changed to quantify each fitting, valve, sleeves, asphalt
restoration, etc.

Regarding the Measurement & Payment:

Fittings that were originally subsidiary to ‘Connection to Existing Pipe’ have been added and
renumbered to match the new schedule of values if they were not already included. Below is
the new schedule of values:

1 Mobilization LS 1

2 Traffic Control LS 1

3 Construction Staking LS 1

4 Clearing & Grubbing LS 1

5 Grading LS 1

6 Remove Existing Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 19
7 Install 6" C900 PVC Waterline LF 3,716
8 Install 6" RJ C900 PVC Waterline LF 931
9 Install 8" C900 PVC Waterline LF 4,024
10 Install 8" RJ C900 PVC Waterline LF 2,126
11 Install 12" C900 PVC Waterline LF 1,680
12 Install 12" RJ C900 PVC Waterline LF 765
13 6" 11.25 Degree Bend EA 2
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14 6" 22.5 Degree Bend EA 4
15 6" 45 Degree Bend EA 47
16 6" 90 Degree Bend EA 7
17 8" 11.25 Degree Bend EA 3
18 8" 22.5 Degree Bend EA 2
19 8" 45 Degree Bend EA 88
20 8" 90 Degree Bend EA 4
21 12" 11.25 Degree Bend EA 5
22 12" 22.5 Degree Bend EA 1
23 12" 45 Degree Bend EA 25
24 12" 90 Degree Bend EA 2
25 8"x6" Reducer EA 4
26 6"x6" Tee EA 8
27 8" Tee EA 2
28 8"x6" Tee EA 7
29 12"x6" Tee EA 1
30 12"x8" Tee EA 5
31 16"x16"x8" Tee EA 1
32 8"x6" Cross EA 1
33 8"x8" Cross EA 1
34 6" Solid Sleeve EA 26
35 8" Solid Sleeve EA 1
36 12" Solid Sleeve EA 5
37 16" Solid Sleeve EA 2
38 Install 6" Gate Valve EA 31
39 Install 8" Gate Valve EA 25
40 Install 12" Gate Valve EA 4
41 Install 16" Butterfly Valve EA 2
42 Install Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 25
43 Water Meter, Pit Replacement, and Connection at Main Line | EA 231
44 Install 3/4" Type "K" Copper Service Line LF 7516
45a Connection to existing pipe (A-6) LS 1
45b Connection to existing pipe (A-8) LS 1
45¢ Connection to existing pipe (A-11) LS 1
45d Connection to existing pipe (B-11) LS 1
45¢ Connection to existing pipe (A-12) LS 1
45f Connection to existing pipe (A-14) LS 1
45g Connection to existing pipe (A-15) LS 1
45h Connection to existing pipe (A-16) LS 1
45i Connection to existing pipe (B-16) LS 1
45j Connection to existing pipe (A-20) LS 1
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435k Connection to existing pipe (B-20)

LS

1
451 Connection to existing pipe (A-21) LS 1
45m Connection to existing pipe (A-23) LS 1
45n Connection to existing pipe (A-26) LS 1
450 Connection to existing pipe (B-26) LS 1
45p Connection to existing pipe (A-28) LS 1
43q Connection to existing pipe (B-28) LS 1
45r Connection to existing pipe (A-29) LS 1
45s Connection to existing pipe (A-30) LS 1
45t Connection to existing pipe (A-31) LS 1
45u Connection to existing pipe (A-35) LS 1
45v Connection to existing pipe (B-35) LS 1
45w | Connection to existing pipe (D-35) LS 1
45x Connection to existing pipe (A-39) LS 1
46 Abandon Existing Water Main LS 45
47 Install Straddle Block EA 87
48 Install Tracer Wire LF 13242
49 Remove & Replace Asphalt Pavement SY 6972
50 Remove & Replace Concrete Drive SY 88
51 Remove and Replace Concrete Sidewalk LF 39
52 Remove and Replace Concrete Curb & Gutter LF 190
53 Sodding LS 1
54 Owner's Allowance ($500,000) LS 1

Additionally the following clarifying clause was added under the ‘BID ALTERNATE PIPE

BURST PACKAGE’ heading:

Each of the below line items serve as a pipe-bursting alternative to open-trenching and
associated difference in restoration. Bidding of one or the other or both the base bid open
trench set (lines 7, 9, and 49) and alternate bid pipe bursting set (lines 7*, 9% and 49*) is
allowed. There will be no mix between the two sets and only one package will be awarded as a
single set. No payment will be made for lines 7, 9, and 49 if lines 7*, 9* and 49* are awarded

and vice versa.

The bid opening date will be moved back to Thursday January 22", 2026 at 10:00 a.m.
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In acknowledgement of receiving this addendum, the contractor shall sign and date below.
A scanned copy of this addendum, in its entirety, must be included with the online bid
submitted at olatheks.bonfirehub.com

Company Name: L€ ““PV\ +§(Y\S IY) C

Printed Name: \Q&%@( W @) LQ!/\"’ l/\/
Signature: / :

Date: </T J\//i( W
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