City of Olathe
IFB 17-4001 - 2019 Vehicles (Johnson County, KS Bid# 2016-002)

Shawnee Mission Ford Olathe Ford Landmark Dodge Chrysler Jeep Summit Trucks MHC Trucks
Shawnee, KS Olathe, KS Overland Park, KS Kansas City, KS Olathe, KS
Item Description RETJ#T;Z?” Quantity| Unit | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
1 |Ford Escape 15908 1 each | $21,908.00| $21,908.00| $23,013.00| $23,013.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |Ford F-250 Supercab 15842 1 each | $26,443.00] $26,443.00[ $27,326.00( $27,326.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 [Ford F-250 Supercab 4X4 15839 1 each [ $29,076.00] $29,076.00[ $29,706.00[ $29,706.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 |Ford F350 4X2 15860 1 each | $27,180.00| $27,180.00f $27,588.00| $27,588.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 [Ford Utility Interceptor AWD 15927 8 each | $34,829.00| $278,632.00] $35,295.00| $282,360.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 |26,000LB GVWR Cab & Chassis 15885 1 each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $72,429.00] $72,429.00{ $68,750.00] $68,750.00
7 |Ford F250 Crew Cab 4X4 15841 1 each [ $29,952.00] $29,952.00[ $31,879.00[ $31,879.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 [Ford Explorer Utility 15873 1 each | $24,215.00] $24,215.00[ $24,780.00[ $24,780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 [Ford F150 4X2 15840 1 each | $29,087.00| $29,087.00] $30,914.00] $30,914.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 |Ford F350 4X4 PD(':A‘_PI;\LAAL 2 each | $27,892.00| $55,784.00( $28,063.00( $56,126.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |Ford F250 Super Cab 4X4 15934 1 each | $28,815.00| $28,815.00] $29,403.00] $29,403.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 [Dodge Charger Palice Vehicle 15928 3 each No Bid No Bid $72,365.00| $217,095.00 No Bid No Bid
13 |37000LB GVWR International Cab & Chassis 15900 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $85,597.00] $85,597.00 No Bid
14 |37000LB GVWR International Cab & Chassis 15899 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $85,597.00] $85,597.00 No Bid
15 gzhoaggiLsB GVWR International Crew Cab & 15902 1| each No Bid No Bid No Bid $83,599.00| $83,599.00 No Bid
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