
Item Description Requisition 
Number Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWD 16232 4 each $34,691.64 $138,766.56 $35,815.00 $143,260.00
2 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWD 16233 3 each $34,691.64 $104,074.92 $35,815.00 $107,445.00
3 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWD 16234 2 each $34,691.64 $69,383.28 $35,815.00 $71,630.00
4 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWD 16235 1 each $34,691.64 $34,691.64 $35,815.00 $35,815.00
5 Ford Police Interceptor Utility AWD 16236 1 each $34,691.64 $34,691.64 $35,815.00 $35,815.00
6 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV 4x4 16230 6 each $38,664.10 $231,984.60

Recommended Award

City of Olathe

Olathe Ford

Olathe, KS

Shawnee Mission Ford

NO BID NO BID

Shawnee, KS

IFB 20-0015 - 2020 Vehicles (Clay County, MO Bid# 49-19)

NO BID

Roberts Chevrolet Buick

Platte City, MO

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
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